
Required Disclosures 
A Closed-end Fund report is for informational purposes only. Neither S&P 
Capital IQ nor its sources guarantee the accuracy, adequacy or completeness of 
a Closed-end Fund report or make any warranties regarding results from its 
usage. When using a Closed-end Fund report, investors are advised to consult 
the accompanying glossary of investment terms. 
 
Throughout a Closed-end Fund , total return performance shown is historical, 
and assumes reinvestment of all dividends and capital gain distributions. Total 
Return, Peer Rank and Category Rank do not take into account loads or any 
other sales charges. An investment in a fund is not a bank deposit. It is not 
insured or guaranteed by the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation (FDIC) or 
any other government agency. Past performance is no guarantee of future 
results, and investment return and principal value will fluctuate so that, when 
redeemed, an investor's shares may be worth more or less than their original 
cost. Current performance may be lower or higher than the performance data 
quoted; performance current to the most recent month-end or calendar quarter-
end is included in the report and can also be obtained from the fund company’s 
website. 
 
The data and information shown in Closed-end Fund report is intended for use 
by financial professionals and/or sophisticated investors who should verify that 
all data, assumptions, and results are accurate before making any investment 
decision or recommendation. Before acting on any information in a Closed-end 
Fund and/or this document, an investor should consider whether the fund is 
suitable for their particular circumstances and, if necessary, seek professional 
advice. 
 
S&P Capital IQ receives compensation from the issuer or an agent thereof 
for initiating coverage, and for distribution including licensed 
redistribution of the report, and/or for inclusion in other S&P publications, 
generally in amounts up to $9,250 per year.   
 
Risks disclaimers 
Investors should read the fund’s prospectus and consider the fund’s investment 
goals, risks, charges and expenses before investing. The Fund may be subject, 
but not limited, to the following investment risks: 
 
Closed end Funds 
Closed-end funds generally issue shares in a public offering and do not continu-
ously offer them for sale but instead sell a fixed number of shares at one time, 
such shares typically trade on a secondary market. Shares of closed-end funds 
frequently trade at a market price that is below their Net Asset Value (NAV).   
 
Leverage risk. Closed-end funds can use leverage, or borrowed money, to 
increase their income distributions. The use of leverage, such as lending 
portfolio securities, entering into futures contracts, investing in inverse floaters, 
and engaging in forward commitment transactions, may cause taxable income 
and may magnify the fund's gains or losses. 
 
Interest rate risk. A sharp and unexpected rise in short term interest rates could 
cause a fund to pay higher rate on its borrowings that it earns on its investments.  
 
Discount risk. Closed-end funds share prices can diverge wildly from its NAV. 
Closed-end funds that fall out of favor trade at a big discount, or significantly 
below their NAV. On the other hand Closed-end funds that have a high demand 
trade at a premium price, or significantly above their NAV. Generally, when 
calculating the income that an investor can expect from a particular Closed-end 
fund, the distribution rate is typically quoted based on the NAV, not on the 
selling price of the shares, although sometimes both will be cited. If an investor 
buys shares at a premium, the real distribution will be lower, and if an investor 
buys at a discount, it will be higher.  
 
Return of capital risk. Some Closed-end funds have a policy of paying out a set 
amount monthly or quarterly even if the fund doesn't have enough interest 
earnings, dividends or capital gains to distribute. The fund may make up the 
difference by returning some of the money investors paid in.  
 
Non-diversification risk. Closed-end funds tend to be non-diversified, which 
means that the fund may invest a relatively high percentage of its assets in a 
limited number of issuers. Therefore, the fund's performance may be more 
vulnerable to changes in the market value of a single issuer or group of issuers 
and more susceptible to risks associated with a single economic, political or 
regulatory occurrence than a diversified fund. 
 

 
Other disclaimers 
S&P Capital IQ or an affiliate may license certain intellectual property or 
provide pricing or other services to, or otherwise have a financial interest in, 
certain issuers of securities, including exchange-traded investments whose 
investment objective is to substantially replicate the returns of a proprietary 
index of S&P Dow Jones Indices, such as the S&P 500. In cases where S&P 
Capital IQ or an affiliate is paid fees that are tied to the amount of assets that 
are invested in the fund or the volume of trading activity in the fund, investment 
in the fund will generally result in S&P Capital IQ or an affiliate receiving 
compensation in addition to the subscription fees or other compensation for 
services rendered by S&P Capital IQ. A reference to a particular investment or 
security by S&P Capital IQ and/or one of its affiliates is not a recommendation 
to buy, sell, or hold such investment or security, nor is it considered to be 
investment advice. 
 
No endorsement of any mutual fund included in Closed-end Fund Report 
should be implied by the fact that the mutual fund bears the S&P Capital IQ 
mark or is based on an S&P Dow Jones Index. S&P Capital IQ does not receive 
fees from mutual funds and/ or funds for their inclusion in Closed-end Fund 
Report. S&P Capital IQ and its affiliates provide a wide range of services to, or 
relating to, many organizations, including issuers of securities, investment 
advisers, broker-dealers, investment banks, other financial institutions and 
financial intermediaries, and accordingly may receive fees or other economic 
benefits from those organizations, including organizations whose securities or 
services they may recommend, rate, include in model portfolios, evaluate or 
otherwise address. 
 
S&P Dow Jones Indices does not sponsor, endorse, sell, promote or manage any 
investment fund or other vehicle that seeks to provide an investment return 
based on the returns of any S&P Dow Jones index. No other unit of Standard & 
Poor’s Financial Services LLC (“S&P”), including S&P Dow Jones Indices, 
contributed to the content of Closed-end Fund Report. S&P does not trade for 
its own account.  
 
Indexes are unmanaged, statistical composites and their returns do not include 
payment of any sales charges or fees an investor would pay to purchase the 
securities they represent. Such costs would lower performance. It is not possible 
to invest directly in an index. 
 
Assumptions, opinions and estimates constitute our judgment as of the date of a 
Closed-end Fund report and/or this material and are subject to change without 
notice. S&P, and its affiliates, and any third-party providers, as well as their 
directors, officers, shareholders, employees or agents (collectively S&P Parties) 
do not guarantee the accuracy, completeness, adequacy or timeliness of any 
information, including ratings, and are not responsible for errors and omissions, 
or for the results obtained from the use of such information, and S&P Parties 
shall have no liability for any errors, omissions, or interruptions therein, 
regardless of the cause, or for the results obtained from the use of such 
information. S&P PARTIES DISCLAIM ANY AND ALL EXPRESS OR 
IMPLIED WARRANTIES, INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, ANY 
WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, SUITABILITY OR FITNESS 
FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE OR USE. In no event shall S&P Parties be 
liable to any party for any direct, indirect, incidental, exemplary, compensatory, 
punitive, special or consequential damages, costs, expenses, legal fees, or losses 
(including, without limitation, lost income or lost profits and opportunity costs) 
in connection with any use of the information contained in a Closed-end Fund 
report and/or this document even if advised of the possibility of such damages.  
 
S&P’s credit ratings are statements of opinion as of the date they are expressed 
and not statements of fact or recommendations to purchase, hold, or sell any 
securities or to make any investment decisions. S&P credit ratings should not be 
relied on when making any investment or other business decision. S&P’s 
opinions and analyses do not address the suitability of any security. S&P does 
not act as a fiduciary or an investment advisor. While S&P has obtained 
information from sources they believe to be reliable, S&P does not perform an 
audit or undertake any duty of due diligence or independent verification of any 
information it receives.  
 
S&P keeps certain activities of its business units separate from each other in 
order to preserve the independence and objectivity of their respective activities. 
As a result, certain business units of S&P may have information that is not 
available to other S&P business units. S&P has established policies and 
procedures to maintain the confidentiality of certain non-public information 
received in connection with each analytical process. 
 



S&P may receive compensation for its ratings and certain credit-related 
analyses, normally from issuers or underwriters of securities or from obligors. 
S&P reserves the right to disseminate its opinions and analyses. S&P's public 
ratings and analyses are made available on its Web sites, 
www.standardandpoors.com (free of charge), and www.ratingsdirect.com and 
www.globalcreditportal.com (subscription), and may be distributed through 
other means, including via S&P publications and third party redistributors. 
Additional information about our ratings fees is available at 
www.standardandpoors.com/usratingsfees.  
 
Standard & Poor’s Ratings Services did not participate in the development of 
Closed-end Fund Report. Credit ratings are not the sole input for determining a 
ranking. Rating criteria and credit rating scales may differ among credit rating 
agencies. Ratings assigned by other credit rating agencies may reflect more or 
less favorable opinions of creditworthiness than ratings assigned by Standard & 
Poor’s Ratings Services.  
 
Closed-end Fund Reports are not intended as an offer or solicitation for the 
purchase or sale of any security or other financial instrument. Securities, 
financial instruments or strategies mentioned herein may not be suitable for all 
investors. Any opinions expressed herein are given in good faith, are subject to 
change without notice, and are only correct as of the stated date of their issue. 
Prices, values, or income from any securities or investments mentioned in 
Closed-end Fund Report may fall against the interests of the investor and the 
investor may get back less than the amount invested. Where an investment is 
described as being likely to yield income, please note that the amount of income 
that the investor will receive from such an investment may fluctuate. Where an 
investment or security is denominated in a different currency to the investor's 
currency of reference, changes in rates of exchange may have an adverse effect 
on the value, price or income of or from that investment to the investor.  The 
information contained in Closed-end Fund Report does not constitute advice on 
the tax consequences of making any particular investment decision. A Closed-
end Fund report and/or this material does not take into account your particular 
investment objectives, financial situations or needs and is not intended as a 
recommendation of particular securities, financial instruments or strategies to 
you nor is it considered to be investment advice. Before acting on any 
recommendation in a Closed-end Fund report and/or this material, you should 
consider whether it is suitable for your particular circumstances and, if 
necessary, seek professional advice.  
 
Canadian investors should be aware that any specific securities discussed in a 
Closed-end Fund Report can only be purchased in Canada through a Canadian 
registered dealer and, if such securities are not available in the secondary 
market, they can only be purchased by eligible private placement purchasers on 
a basis that is exempt from the prospectus requirements of Canadian securities 
law and will be subject to resale restrictions. Information in Closed-end Fund 
Report may not be suitable or appropriate for Canadian investors.  Only a 
registered distributor is eligible to distribute excerpts of any report, and 
distributor will be deemed to assume regulatory responsibility for the excerpted 
information, and undertakes to provide notice to clients that it will be assuming 
such responsibility.  
  
Closed end Fund Reports’ investment analysis was prepared using the 
following sources: S&P Equity Research Services; Standard & Poor's, 55 Water 
St., New York, NY 10041. All reference and performance data is provided by 
Lipper. Performance data is total return, and is preliminary and subject to 
revision. Reference information has been obtained from company and financial 
reports and other resources believed to be reliable and maybe incomplete and is 
not guaranteed by Lipper Inc. – A Reuters Company. No offer or solicitation to 
buy or sell any of the securities herein is being made by Lipper. 
 
Additional information may be available upon request. 

http://www.globalcreditportal.com/
http://www.standardandpoors.com/usratingsfees

	Required Disclosures
	Risks disclaimers
	Closed end Funds
	Discount risk. Closed-end funds share prices can diverge wildly from its NAV. Closed-end funds that fall out of favor trade at a big discount, or significantly below their NAV. On the other hand Closed-end funds that have a high demand trade at a prem...
	Return of capital risk. Some Closed-end funds have a policy of paying out a set amount monthly or quarterly even if the fund doesn't have enough interest earnings, dividends or capital gains to distribute. The fund may make up the difference by return...

	Other disclaimers

